10/29/25, 3:27 AM Gmail - RE: **EXTERNAL**Fwd: Final payment invoices for Solid Foundations

M Gmail Shawn Martin <sem2000s@gmail.com>

RE: **EXTERNAL**Fwd: Final payment invoices for Solid Foundations

1 message

Inga Samuels <isamuels@jeafinancialgroup.com> Wed, Jan 8, 2025 at 8:33 AM
To: Patty Sabates <psabates48@gmail.com>, Elizabeth P <elizabeth.palen@hotmail.com>, Maude King-Bruce <maudekbruce2@gmail.com>, Maritza Wilhelm
<maritzawilhelm@yahoo.com>, Marjorie Thomas <mcthom71@gmail.com>, Miriam Tirado <miriam71@comcast.net>, Shawn Martin <sem2000s@gmail.com>,
"bjlapides@bellsouth.net" <bjlapides@bellsouth.net>, Office Support YMS <info@yourmanagementservices.com>

Hi Patty

Thank you.

Inga-Marie Samuels

Accounts Payable
www.jeafinancialgroup.com

Plantation - Serving Florida Since 1984
954-577-9700

\ Juda-Eskew
8 ASSOCIATES

Providing Association Financial Services since 1984

This message was sent on 1/8/2025 8:33 AM UTC-05:00

From: Patty Sabates <psabates48@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 8, 2025 5:51 AM

To: Elizabeth P <elizabeth.palen@hotmail.com>; Maude King-Bruce <maudekbruce2@gmail.com>; Maritza Wilhelm <maritzawilhelm@yahoo.com>; Marjorie Thomas <mcthom71@gmail.com>; Miriam
Tirado <miriam71@comcast.net>; Shawn Martin <sem2000s@gmail.com>; Patty Sabates <psabates48@gmail.com>; Inga Samuels <isamuels@)jeafinancialgroup.com>; bjlapides@bellsouth.net; Office
Support YMS <info@yourmanagementservices.com>

Subject: **EXTERNAL**Fwd: Final payment invoices for Solid Foundations
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content
is safe.

All

FYI below

Diana please let proscapes know that end unit is completed.
Inga please process invoice

Thank you

Patty Sabates Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: larry@s-deng.com

Date: January 7, 2025 at 10:23:54 PM EST

To: Patty Sabates <psabates48@gmail.com>, Blaire Lapides <bjlapides@bellsouth.net>
Cc: Office Support YMS <info@yourmanagementservices.com>

Subject: Final payment invoices for Solid Foundations

Happy new year to all.

Solid foundation have completed the foundation works on units 1741, 1745 and 1749 in Phase 4. Permits for 1741 and 1749 are closed to date, 1745
is scheduled for City inspection on 1/8/2025.

The attached invoices are for the balance of payment due to Solid Foundations.

Regards,

Larry Alcendor, E.I

Project Manager/Engineer/Inspector
754-465-4665 Cell

954-775-0143 Ph
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S&D Engineering and Construction Inc.
1031 NW 31st Avenue
Pompano Beach, FL 33069
Office: (954) 775-0143
www.s-deng.com
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